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COUNCIL ON ENVIRONMENTAL 
QUALITY 

[4 0  CFR Ch. V ]
PREPARATION OF ENVIRONMENTAL 

IMPACT STATEMENTS
Proposed Guidelines

The Council on Environmental Quality 
invites comments and suggestions from 
interested parties with respect to the fol-
lowing proposed revisions of the Coun-
cil's guidelines on the preparation of en-
vironmental impact statements pursu-
ant to section 102(2) (C) of the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) (42 
U.S.C. section 4332(2) (c )) . The present 
guidelines, dated April 23,1971, are avail-
able from the Council and appear at 36 
PR 7724-7729.

Comments should be sent to the Coun-
cil on Environmental Quality, 722 Jack- 
son Place NW., Washington, D.C. 20006, 
on or before June 18,1973.

After consideration of the comments 
and views of interested parties, the 
Council will make appropriate revisions 
and will codify these guidelines in final 
form in the Code of Federal Regulations, 
establishing a new chapter 5 to title 40 
of that Code.

The proposed revisions and' a section- 
by-section commentary follow:

1. Purpose and authority.— (a) This 
directive provides guidelines to Federal 
departments, agencies, and establish-
ments for preparing detailed environ-
mental statements on proposals for 
legislation and other major Federal ac-
tions significantly affecting the quality 
of the human environment as required by 
section 102(2) (C) of the National En-
vironmental Policy Act (Public Law 
91-190, 42 U.S.C. sections 4321 et seq.) 
(hereafter “ the Act” ). Underlying the 
preparation of such environmental 
statements is the mandate of both the 
Act and Executive Order 11514 (35 FR 
4247), of March 5, 1970, that all Federal 
agencies, to the fullest extent possible, 
direct their policies, plans, and programs 
so as to meet national environmental 
goals to encourage productive and enjoy-
able harmony between man and his en-
vironment, to promote efforts preventing 
or eliminating damage to the environ-
ment and biosphere and stimulating the 
health and welfare of man, and to enrich 
the understanding of the ecological sys-
tems and natural resources important to 
the Nation. The objective of section 102 
(2) (C) of the Act and of these guide-
lines is to build into the agency de-
cisionmaking process, beginning at the 
earliest possible point, an appropriate 
and careful consideration of the environ-
mental aspects of proposed action and 
to assist agencies in implementing the 
policies as well as the letter of the Act. 
This directive also provides guidance to 
Federal, State, and local agencies and 
the public in commenting on statements 
prepared under these guidelines.

(b) Pursuant to section 204(3) of the 
Act the Council is assigned the duty and 
function of reviewing and appraising the 
programs and activities of the Federal
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Government, in the light of the Act’s 
policy, for the purpose of determining the 
extent to which such programs and acti-
vities are contributing to the achieve-
ment of such policy, and to make recom-
mendations to the President with respect 
thereto. Section 102(2) (B) of the Act 
directs all Federal agencies to identify 
and develop methods and procedures, in 
consultation with the Council,-to insure 
that unquantified environmental values 
be given appropriate consideration in 
decisionmaking along with economic and 
technical considerations; section 102(2) 
(C) of the Act directs that copies of 
all environmental impact statements be 
filed with the Council; and section 102(2) 
(H) directs all Federal agencies to 
assist the Council in the performance of 
its functions. These provisions have been 
supplemented in sections 3 (h) and (i) 
of Executive Order 11514 by directions 
that the Council issue guidelines to Fed-
eral agencies for preparation of environ-
mental impact statements and such 
other instructions to agencies and re-
quests for reports and information as 
may be required to carry out the Council’s 
responsibilities under the Act.

2. Policy.—As early as possible and in 
all cases prior to agency decision con-
cerning recommendations or favorable 
reports on proposals for: (i) Legislation 
significantly affecting the quality of the 
human environment (see secs. 5(1) and 
12, infra) (hereafter “legislative ac-
tions"), and (ii) all other major Fed-
eral actions significantly affecting the 
quality of the human environment 
(hereafter “administrative actions” ) , 
Federal agencies will, in consultation 
with other appropriate Federal, State, 
and local agencies, assess in detail the 
potential environmental impact. Initial 
assessments of the environmental im-
pacts of proposed action should be under-
taken Concurrently with initial techni-
cal and economic studies and, where re-
quired, a draft environmental impact 
statement prepared and circulated for 
comment in time to accompany the pro-
posal through the existing agency re-
view processes for such action. In this 
process, Federal agencies shall: (i) Pro-
vide for circulation of draft environ-
mental statements to other Federal, 
State, and local agencies and for their 
availability to the public in accordance 
with the provisions of these guidelines;
(ii) consider the comments of the agen-
cies and the public; and (iii) issue final 
environmental impact statements re-
sponsive to the comments received. The 
purpose of this assessment and consul-
tation process is to provide agencies 
and other decisionmakers as well as 
members of the public with an under-
standing of the potential environmental 
effects of proposed actions, to avoid or 
minimize adverse effects wherever pos-
sible, and to restore or enhance environ-
mental quality to the fullest extent prac-
ticable. In particular, agencies should 
use the environmental impact statement 
process to explore alternative actions 
that will avoid or minimize adverse im-
pacts and to evaluate both the long- and

short-range implications of proposed 
actions to man, his physical and social 
surroundings, and to nature. Agencies 
should consider the results of their en-
vironmental assessments along with their 
assessments of the net economic, tech-
nical, and other benefits of proposed 
actions and use all practicable means, 
consistent with other essential consid-
erations of national policy, to avoid or 
minimize undesirable consequences for 
the environment.

3. Agency and OMB procedures.—(a) 
Pursuant to section 2(f) of Executive 
Order 11514, tlje heads of Federal agen-
cies have been directed to proceed with 
measures required by section 102(2) (C) 
of the Act. Previous guidelines of the 
Council on Environmental Quality di-
rected each agency to establish its own 
formal procedures for: (1) Identifying 
those agency actions requiring environ-
mental statements, the appropriate time 
prior to decision for the consultations re-
quired by section 102(2) (C) and the 
agency review process for which environ-
mental statements are to be available, 
(2) obtaining information required in 
their preparation, (3) designating the 
officials who are to be responsible for the 
statements, (4) consulting with and tak-
ing account of the comments of appro-
priate Federal, State, and local agencies, 
including obtaining the comment of the 
Administrator of the Environmental 
Protection Agency when required under 
section 309 of the Clean Air Act, as 
amended, and (5) meeting the require-
ments of section 2(b) of Executive Order 
11514 for providing timely public infor-
mation on Federal plans and programs 
with environmental impact. Each agency 
shall review the procedures it has estab-
lished pursuant to the above directives 
and shall revise them, in consultation 
with the Council on Environmental Qual-
ity, as may be necessary in order to re-
spond to requirements imposed by these 
revised guidelines as well as by such 
previous directives. After such con-
sultation, proposed revisions of such 
agency procedures shall be published 
in the Fe d e r a l  R e g is t e r  no later 
than 90 days after the date that 
these guidelines are published in final 
form. A minimum 45-day period for 
public comment shall be provided, fol-
lowed by publication of final procedures 
no later than 45 daysafter the conclusion 
of the comment period. Each agency 
shall submit seven copies of all such pro-
cedures to the Council on Environmental 
Quality. Any future revision of such 
agency procedures shall similarly be pro-
posed and adopted only after prior con-
sultation with the Council and, in the 
case of substantial, revision, opportunity 
for public comment.

(b) Each Federal agency should con-
sult, with the assistance of the Council 
on Environmental Quality and the Of-
fice of Management and Budget if de-
sired, with other appropriate Federal 
agencies in the development and revi-
sion of the above procedures so as to 
achieve consistency in dealing with 
similar activities and to assure effective
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coordination among agencies in their 
review of proposed activities. Where ap-
plicable, State and local review of such 
agency procedures should be conducted 
pursuant to procedures established by 
Office of Management and Budget Cir-
cular No. A-85. For those revised agency 
procedures subject to OMB Circular No. 
A-85 a 30-day extension in the public 
comment period provided for in section 
3(a) is granted.

(c) Existing mechanisms for obtain-
ing the views of Federal, State, and local 
agencies on proposed Federal actions 
should be utilized to the maximum ex-
tent practicable in dealing with environ-
mental matters. The Office of Manage-
ment and Budget will issue instructions, 
as necessary, to take full advantage of 
such existing mechanisms.

4. Federal agencies included; effect of 
the Act on existing agency mandates.— 
Section 102(2) (C) of the Act applies to 
all agencies of thé Federal Government. 
Section 102 of the' Act provides that 
“to the fullest extent possible: (1) The 
policies, regulations, and public laws of 
the United States shall be interpreted 
and administered in accordance with the 
policies set forth in this Act,” and sec-
tion 105 of the Act provides that “ the 
policies and goals set forth in this 'Act 
are supplementary to those set forth in 
existing authorizations of Federal agen-
cies.” This means that each agency shall 
interpret the provisions of the Act as a 
supplement to its existing authority and 
as a mandate to view traditional poli-
cies and missions in the light of the 
Act’s national environmental objectives. 
In accordance with this purpose, agencies 
should continue to review their policies, 
procedures, and regulations and to re-
vise them as necessary to insure full 
compliance with the purposes and pro-
visions of the Act. The phrase “to the 
fullest extent possible” in section 102 is 
meant to make clear that each agency 
of the Federal Government shall com-
ply with that section unless existing law 
applicable to the agency’s operations ex-
pressly prohibits or makes compliance 
impossible.

5. Actions included.—“Actions” in-
clude but are not limited to :

(i) Recommendations or favorable 
reports relating to legislation including 
requests for appropriations. The require-
ment for following the section 102(2) (C) 
procedure as elaborated in these guide-
lines applies to both (i) agency recom-
mendations on their own proposals for 
legislation (see section 12 infra) ; and
(ii) agency reports on legislation initi-
ated elsewhere. In the latter case only 
tne agency which has primary responsi-
bility for the subject matter involved will 
Prepare an environmental statement.

(U) New and continuing projects and 
program activities: directly undertaken 
*  federal agencies; or supported in 
whole or in part through Federal con-
tracts, grants, subsidies, loans, or other 
forms of funding assistance (except 
where such assistance is solely in the 
¡ " 2 *  general revenue sharing funds, 
mstributed under the State and Local 
«seal Assistance Act of 1972, 31 U.S.C.

section 1221 et seq. with no Federal 
agency control over the subsequent use 
of such funds); or involving a Federal 
lease, permit, license, certificate or other 
entitlement for use;

(iii) The making, modification, or es-
tablishment of regulations, rules, pro-
cedures, and policy.

6. Identifying major actions signifi-
cantly affecting the environment.— (a) 
The statutory clause “major Federal ac-
tions significantly affecting the quality 
of the human environment” is to be con-
strued by agencies with a view to the 
overall, cumulative impact of the action 
proposed (and of further actions con-
templated). Such actions may be local-
ized in their impact, but if there is poten-
tial that the environment may be sig-
nificantly affected, the statement is to 
be prepared. Proposed major actions, the 
environmental impact of which is likely 
to be highly controversial, should be cov-
ered in' all cases. In considering what 
constitutes major action significantly af-
fecting the environment, agencies should 
bear in mind that the effect of many 
Federal decisions about a project or com-
plex of projects can be individually lim-
ited but cumulatively considerable. This 
can occur when one or more agencies 
over a period of years puts into a project 
individually minor but collectively major 
resources, when one decision involving 
a limited amount of money is a prece-
dent for action in much larger cases or 
represents a decision in principle about 
a future major course of action, or when 
several Government agencies individu-
ally make decisions about partial aspects 
of a major action: In all such cases, an 
environmental statement should be pre-
pared if it is reasonable to anticipate a 
cumulatively significant impact on the 
environment from Federal action. The 
Council on Environmental Quality, on 
the basis of a written assessment of the 
impacts involved, is available to assist 
agencies in determining whether specific 
actions require impact statements.

(b) Section 101(b) of the Act indi-
cates the broad range of aspects of the 
environment to be surveyed in any as-
sessment of significant effect. The Act 
also indicates that adverse significant 
effect. The Act also indicates that ad-
verse significant effects include those 
that degrade the quality of the envi-
ronment, curtail the range of bene-
ficial uses of the environment, and 
serve short-term, to the disadvantage 
of long-term, environmental goals. Sig-
nificant effects can also include actions 
which may have both beneficial and 
detrimental effects, even if on balance 
the agency believes that the effect will 
be beneficial. Significant effects also in-
clude secondary effects, as described 
more fully, for example in sec. 8(a) (ii) 
(B ), infra. The significance of a proposed 
action may also vary with the setting, 
with the result that an action that would 
have little impact in an urban area may 
be significant in a rural setting or vice 
versa. While a precise definition of en-
vironmental “significance,” valid in all 
contexts, is not possible, effects to be 
considered in assessing significance in-

clude, but are not limited, to those out-
lined in appendix n  of these guidelines.

(c) Each of the provisions of the Act, 
except section 102(2) (C), applies to all 
Federal agency actions. Section 102(2) 
(C) requires the preparation of a de-
tailed environmental impact statement 
in the case of “major Federal ac-
tions significantly affecting the qual-
ity of the human environment.” The 
identification of major actions signifi-
cantly affecting the environment is the 
responsibility of each Federal agency, 
to be carried out against the background 
of its own particular operations. The ac-
tion must be (i) a “major” action, (ii) 
which is a “Federal action,” (iii) which 
has a “significant” effect, and (iv) which 
involves the “quality of the human en-
vironment.” The words “major” and 
“significantly” are intended to imply 
thresholds of importance and impact 
that must be met before a statement is 
required. The action causing the impact 
must also be one where there is suffi-
cient Federal control and responsibility 
to constitute “Federal action” in con-
trast to cases where such Federal control 
and responsibility are not present as, for 
example, when Federal funds are dis-
tributed in the form of general revenue 
sharing to be used by State and local 
governments (see sec. 5(ii) supra). 
Finally, the action must be one that 
significantly affects the quality of the 
human environment either by directly 
affecting human beings or by indirectly 
affecting human beings through adverse 
effects on the environment. Each agency 
should review the typical classes of ac-
tions that it undertakes and, in consul-
tation with the Council on Environ-
mental Quality, should develop specific 
criteria and methods for identifying 
those actions likely to require environ-
mental statements and those actions 
likely not to require environmental 
statements. Normally this will involve:

(i) Making an initial assessment of 
the environmental impacts typically as-
sociated with principal types of agency 
action;

(ii) Identifying on the basis of thip 
assessment, types of actions which 
normally do, and types of actions which 
normally do not, require statements;

(iii) With respect to remaining actions 
that may require statements depending 
on the circumstances, and those actions 
determined under the preceding para-
graph (ii) as likely to require state-
ments, identifying: (1) What basic in-
formation needs to be gathered; (2) how 
and when such information is to be as-
sembled and analyzed; and (3) on what 
bases environmental assessments and 
decisions to prepare impact statements 
will be made. Agencies may either in-
clude this guidance in the procedures is-
sued pursuant to section 3(a) of .these 
guidelines, or issue such guidance as 
supplemental instructions to aid rele-
vant agency personnel in implementing 
the impact statement process. Pursuant 
to section 15 of these guidelines, agencies
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shall report to the Council by Decem-
ber 1, 1973, on the progress made in de-
veloping such substantive guidance.

(d) In determining when statements 
are required, agencies should give care-
ful attention to identifying and defining 
the scope of the action which would most 
appropriately serve as the subject of the 
statement. In many cases, broad program 
statements will be desirable, assessing the 
environmental effects of a number of 
individual actions on a given geographi-
cal area (e.g., coal leases), or environ-
mental impacts that are generic or com-
mon to a series of agencv actions (e.g., 
harbor maintenance dredging), or the 
overall impact of a large-scale program 
or chain of contemplated projects (e.g., 
major lengths of highway as opposed to 
small segments), or the environmental 
implications of research activities that 
have reached a stage of investment or 
commitment to implementation likely to 
determine subsequent development or 
restrict later alternatives. Subsequent 
statements on major individual actions 
should be necessary only where such 
actions have significant environmental 
impacts not adequately evaluated in the 
program statement.

7. Procedures for preparing draft en-
vironmental statements; hearings.— (a) 
In accord with the policy of the Act and 
Executive Order 11514 agencies have 
a responsibility to develop procedures to 
insure the fullest practicable provision of 
timely public information and under-
standing of Federal plans and programs 
with environmental impact in order to 
obtain the views of interested parties. In 
furtherance of this policy, agency proce-
dures should include an apnropriate earlv 
notice system for informing the public 
of the decision to prepare a draft environ-
mental statement on proposed adminis-
trative actions (and for soliciting com-
ments that may be helpful in preparing 
the statement) as soon as is practicable 
after the decision to prepare the state-
ment is made. In this connection, agen-
cies should: (i) Maintain a list of ad-
ministrative actions for which environ-
mental statements -are being prepared; 
(ii) revise the list at regular intervals 
specified in the agency’s procedures de-
veloped pursuant to section 3(a) of these 
guidelines; and (iii) make the list avail-
able for public inspection on request.

(b) Each environmental impact state-
ment shall be prepared and circulated 
in draft form for comment in accordance 
with the provisions of these guidelines. 
(Where an agency has an established 
practice of declining to favor an alter-
native until public comments on a pro-
posed action have been received, the 
draft environmental statement may in-
dicate that two or more alternatives are 
under consideration.) Comments re-
ceived shall be carefully evaluated and 
considered in the decision process. A final 
statement with substantive comments 
attached shall then be issued and cir-
culated in accordance with applicable 
provisions of sections 10, 11, or 12 of this 
directive. It is important that draft envi-
ronmental statements be prepared and

circulated-for comment and furnished 
to the Council as early as possible in the 
agency review process in order to permit 
agency decisionmakers and outside re-
viewers to give meaningful consideration 
to the environmental issues involved. In 
particular, agencies should keep in mind 
that such statements are to serve as the 
means of assessing the environmental 
impact of proposed agency actions, rather 
than as a justification for decisions al-
ready made. This means'that draft state-
ments on administrative actions should 
be prepared and circulated for comment 
prior to the first significant point of de-
cision in the agency review process. For 
major categories of agency action, this 
point should be identified in the proce-
dures issued pursuant to section 3(a).

(c) Where more than one agency di-
rectly sponsors an action, or is directly 
involved through funding, licenses, or 
permits, to the maximum extent possible 
one statement should serve as the means 
of compliance with section 102(2) (C) 
for all Federal action involved. Agencies 
in such cases should consider the possi-
bility of joint preparation of a statement 
by all agencies concerned, or designa-
tion of a single “lead agency” to as-
sume supervisory responsibility for prep-
aration of the statement. Where a lead 
agency prepares the statement, the other 
agencies involved should provide assist-
ance with respect to their areas of juris-
diction and expertise. In either case, the 
statement should contain an environ-
mental assessment of the full range of 
Federal actions involved, should reflect 
the views of all participating agencies, 
and should be prepared before major or 
irreversible actions have been taken by 
any of the participating agencies. Fac-
tors relevant in determining an appro-
priate lead agency include the time se-
quence in which the agencies become in-
volved, the magnitude of their respective 
involvement, and their relative expertise 
with respect to the project’s environ-
mental effects. As necessary, the Council 
on Environmental Quality will assist in 
resolving questions of responsibility for 
statement preparation in the case of 
multiagency actions.

(d) Where an agency relies on an ap-
plicant to submit initial environmental 
information, the agency should assist the 
applicant by outlining the types of infor-
mation required. In all cases, the agency 
should make its own evaluation of the 
environmental issues and take respon-
sibility for the scope and content of draft 
and final environmental statements.

(e) Agency procedures developed pur-
suant to section 3(a) of these guidelines 
shall include provision for public hear-
ings on actions with environmental im-
pact whenever appropriate, and for pro-
viding the public with relevant infor-
mation, including information on alter-
native courses of action. In deciding 
whether a public hearing is appropriate, 
an agency should consider: (i) The 
magnitude of the proposal in terms of 
economic costs, the geographic area in-
volved, and the uniqueness or size of 
commitment of the resources involved;

(ii) the degree of interest in the pro-
posal, as evidenced by requests from the 
public and from Federal, State and local 
authorities that a hearing be held; (iii) 
the complexity of the issue and the like-
lihood that information will be presented 
at the hearing which will be of assist-
ance to the agency in fulfilling its re-
sponsibilities under the Act; (iv) the 
extent to which public involvement al-
ready has been achieved through other 
means, such as earlier public hearings, 
meetings with citizen representatives, 
and/or written comments on the pro-
posed action. Agency procedures should 
also indicate as explicitly as possible 
those types of agency decisions or ac-
tions which utilize hearings as part of 
the normal agency review process, either 
as a result of statutory requirement or 
agency practice. Agencies should make 
any draft environmental statement 
available to the public at least 15 days 
prior to the time of such hearings.

8. Content of environmental state- 
ments.— (a) The following points are to 
be covered:

(i) A description of the proposed action 
and of the environment affected, includ-
ing information, summary technical 
data, and maps and diagrams where 
relevant, adequate to permit an assess-
ment of potential environmental impact 
by commenting agencies and the public. 
Highly technical and specialized analyses 
and data should be avoided in the body 
of the draft impact statement. Such ma-
terials should be attached as appendices 
or footnoted with adequate bibliographic 
references. The statement should also 
succinctly describe the environment of 
the area affected as it exists prior to a 
proposed action. The amount of detail 
provided in such descriptions should be 
commensurate with the extent and ex-
pected impact of the action, and with, 
the amount of information required at 
the particular level of decisionmaking 
(planning, feasibility, design, etc.). In 
order to insure accurate descriptions 
and environmental assessments, site 
visits should be made where feasible. 
Agencies should also take care to identify, 
as appropriate, population and growth 
characteristics of the affected area and 
any population and growth assumptions 
used to justify the project or program 
or to determine secondary population 
and growth impacts resulting from the 
proposed action and its alternatives (see 
par. (ii) (B ), infra). In discussing these 
population aspects, agencies should give 
consideration to using the rates of 
growth in the region of the project con-
tained in the projection compiled for 
the Water Resources Council by the 
Office of Business Economics of the De-
partment of Commerce and the Eco-
nomic Research Service of tlie Depart-
ment of Agriculture (the OBERS pro-
jection). In any event it is essential 
that the sources of data used be 
identified.

(ii) The probable impact of the pro-
posed action on the environment.

(A) This requires agencies to assess 
the positive and negative effects of the
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proposed action as it affects both the 
national and international environment. 
The attention given to different environ-
mental factors will vary according to the 
nature, scale, and location of proposed 
actions. Among factors to consider should 
be the potential effect of the action on 
such aspects of the environment as those 
listed in appendix n  of these guidelines. 
Primary attention should be given in the 
statement to discussing those factors 
most evidently impacted by the proposed 
action.

(B) Secondary, as well as primary 
consequences for the environment should 
be included in the analysis. Many major 
Federal actions, in particular those that 
involve the construction or licensing of 
infrastructure investments (e.g., high-
ways, airports, sewer systems, water re-
source projects, etc.), stimulate or induce 
secondary effects in the form of asso-
ciated investments and changed patterns 
of social and economic activities. Such 
secondary effects, through their impacts 
on existing community facilities and ac-
tivities and through inducing new facil-
ities and activities, may often be even 
more substantial than the primary 
effects of the original action itself. For 
example, the effects of the proposed ac-
tion on population and growth may be 
among the more significant secondary 
effects. Such population and growth im-
pacts should be estimated if expected to 
be significant (using data identified as 
indicated in section 8(a) (i) , supra) and 
an assessment made of the effect of any 
possible change in population patterns 
or growth upon the resource base, in-
cluding land use, water, and public serv-
ices, of the area in question.

(Ui) Alternatives to the proposed ac-
tion, including, where relevant, those not 
within the existing authority of the re-
sponsible agency. (Section 102(2) (D) of 
the Act requires the responsible agency 
to “study, develop, and describe appro-
priate alternatives to recommended 
courses of action in any proposal which 
involves unresolved conflicts concerning 
alternative uses of available resources” ) . 
A rigorous exploration and objective 
evaluation of the environmental impacts 
of all reasonable alternative actions, par-
ticularly those that might avoid some or 
all of the adverse environmental effects, 
is essential. Sufficient analysis of such 
alternatives and their environmental 
costs and impact on the environment 
should accompany the proposed action 
through the agency review process in 
order not to foreclose prematurely op-
tions which might have less detrimental 
effects. Examples of such alternatives in-
clude: The alternative of taking no ac-
tion or of postponing action pending 
further study; alternatives requiring ac- 

°* a significantly different nature 
which would provide similar benefits with 
different environmental impacts (e.g., 
nonstructural alternatives to flood con-
trol programs, or mass transit alterna-
tives to highway construction); alterna-
tives related to different designs or 
details of the proposed action which 
would present different environmental

impacts (e.g., cooling ponds vs. cool-
ing towers for a powerplant or alterna-
tives that will significantly conserve 
energy). In each case, the analysis should 
be sufficiently detailed to permit com-
parative evaluation of the environmental 
benefits, costs and risks of the proposed 
action and each reasonable alternative, 
provided, however, that where an exist-
ing impact statement already contains 
such an analysis, its treatment of alter-
natives may be incorporated.

(iv) Any probable adverse environ-
mental effects which cannot be avoided 
(such as water or air pollution, unde-
sirable land use patterns, damage to life 
systems, urban congestion, threats to 
health, or other consequences adverse to 
the environmental goals set out in sec-
tion 101(b) of the Act). This should be 
a brief section summarizing in one place 
those effects discussed in paragraph (ii) 
that are adverse and unavoidable under 
the proposed action. Included for pur-
poses of contrast should be a clear state-
ment of how other adverse effects dis-
cussed in paragraph (ii) will be miti-
gated to prevent apparent unavoidable 
consequences.

(v) The relationship between local 
short-term uses of man’s environment 
and the maintenance and enhancement 
of long-term productivity. This section 
should contain a brief discussion of the 
extent to which the proposed action in-
volves tradeoffs between short-term en-
vironmental gains at the expense of 
long-term losses, or vice versa. In this 
context short term and long term do 
not refer to any fixed time periods, but 
should be viewed in terms of the envi-
ronmentally significant consequences of 
the proposed action.

(vi) Any irreversible and irretrievable 
commitments of resources that would be 
involved in the proposed action should it 
be implemented. This requires the agency 
to identify from its survey of unavoid-
able impacts in paragraph (iv) the ex-
tent to which the action irreversibly cur-
tails the range of potential uses of the 
environment. Agencies should avoid con-
struing the term “resources” to mean 
only the labor and materials devoted to 
an action. “Resources” also means the 
natural and cultural resources commit-
ted to loss or destruction by the action.

(b) In developing the above points, 
agencies should make every effort to 
convey the required information. suc-
cinctly in a form easily understood, both 
by members of the public and by public 
decisionmakers, giving attention to the 
substance of the information conveyed 
rather than to the particular form, or 
length, or detail of the statement. Each 
of the above points, for example, need 
not always occupy a distinct section of 
the statement if it is otherwise ade-
quately covered in discussing the impact 
of the proposed action and its alterna-
tives—which items should normally be 
the focus of the statement. Draft state-
ments should indicate at appropriate 
points in the text any underlying stud-
ies, reports, and other information ob-
tained and considered by the agency in

preparing the statement including any 
cost-benefit analyses prepared by the 
agency. In the case of documents not 
likely to be easily accessible (such as in-
ternal studies or reports), the agency 
should indicate how such information 
may be obtained. If such information is 
attached to the statement, care should 
be taken to insure that the statement 
remains an essentially selfcontained in-
strument, capable of being understood by 
the reader 'without the need for undue 
cross reference.

(c) Each environmental statement 
should be prepared in accordance with 
the precept in section 102(2) (A) of the 
Act that all agencies of the Federal 
Government, “utilize a systematic, in-
terdisciplinary approach which will in-
sure the integrated use of the natural 
and social sciences and the environmen-
tal design arts in planning and decision-
making which may have an impact on 
man’s environment.” Agencies should at-
tempt to have relevant disciplines rep-
resented on their own staffs; where this 
is not feasible they should make appro-
priate use of relevant Federal, State, 
and local agencies or the professional 
services of universities and outside con-
sultants. The interdisciplinary approach 
should not be limited to the prepara-
tion of the environmental impact state-
ment, but should also be used in the 
early planning stages of the proposed 
action. Early application of such an ap-
proach should help assure a systematic 
evaluation of reasonable alternative 
courses of action and their potential 
social, economic, and environmental 
consequences.

(d) Appendix I prescribes the form of 
the summary sheet which should accom-
pany each draft and final environmental 
statement.

8. Review of draft environmental im-
pact statements by appropriate Federal, 
Federal-State, State, and local agencies 
and by public.— (a) Federal agency re-
view.—In general. A Federal agency 
considering an action requiring an envi-
ronmental statement should consult 
with, and (on the basis of a draft envi^ 
ronmental statement for which the 
agency takes responsibility) obtain the 
comment on the environmental impact 
of the action of Federal and Federal- 
State agencies with jurisdiction by law 
or special- expertise with respect to any 
environmental impact involved. These 
Federal and Federal-State agencies and 
their relevant areas of expertise include 
those identified in appendix n  to these 
guidelines. It is recommended that the 
listed departments and agencies establish 
contact points, which may be regional 
offices, for providing comments on the 
environmental statements. The require-
ment in section 102(2) (C) to obtain 
comment from Federal agencies having 
jurisdiction or special expertise is in 
addition to any specific statutory obli-
gation of any Federal agency to coordi-
nate or consult with any other Federal 
or State agency. Agencies should, for
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example, be alert to consultation require-
ments of the Fish and Wildlife Coordi-
nation Act, 16 U.S.C. sections 661 et seq., 
and the National Historic Preservation 
Act of 1966,16 U.S.C. sections 470 et seq. 
To the extent possible, statements or 
findings concerning environmental im-
pact required by such other statutes, as 
in the case of section 4(f) of the Depart-
ment of Transportation Act of 1966, 49 
U.S.C. section 1653(f), or section 106 of 
the National Historic Preservation Act 
of 1966, should be combined with com-
pliance with the environmental impact 
statement requirements of section 102 
(2) (C) of the Act to yield a single doc-
ument which meets all applicable re-
quirements. The Advisory Council on 
Historic Preservation, the Department 
of Transportation, and the Department 
of the Interior, in consultation with the 
Council on Environmental Quality, will 
issue any necessary supplementing in-
structions for furnishing information or 
findings not forthcoming under the en-
vironmental impact statement process.

(b) EPA review under Clean Air Act.— 
Section 309 of the Clean Air Act, as 
amended (42 U.S.C. sec. 1857h-7), pro-
vides that the Administrator of the En-
vironmental Protection Agency shall 
comment in writing on the environ-
mental impact of any matter relating 
to his duties and responsibilities, and 
shall refer to the Council on Environ-
mental Quality any matter that the Ad-
ministrator determines is unsatisfactory 
from the standpoint of public health or 
welfare or environmerital quality. Ac-
cordingly, wherever an agency action re-
lated to air or water quality, noise#abate- 
ment and control, pesticide regulation, 
solid waste disposal, generally applicable 
environmental radiation criteria and 
standards, or other provision of the au-
thority of the Administrator is involved, 
Federal agencies are required to submit 
such proposed actions to the Administra-
tor for review and comment in writing. 
In all case’s where EPA determines that 
proposed agency action is environ-
mentally unsatisfactory, or where EPA 
determines that an environmental state-
ment is so inadequate that such a de-
termination cannot be made, EPA shall 
notify the Council on Environmental 
Quality as soon as practicable. The Ad-
ministrator’s comments shall constitute 
his comments for the purposes of both 
section 309 of the Clean Air Act and sec-
tion 102(2) (C) of the National Environ-
mental Policy Act.

(c) State and local review.—Office of 
Management and Budget Circular No. 
A-95 (Revised) through its system of 
State and areawide clearinghouses pro-
vides a means for securing the views of 
State and local environmental agencies, 
which can assist in the preparation and 
review of environmental impact state-
ments. Current instructions for obtain-
ing the views of such agencies are 
contained in the joint OMB-CEQ memo-
randum attached to these guidelines as 
appendix HI. A current listing of clear-
inghouses is issued periodically by the 
Office of Management and Budget.

(d) Public review.—Agency procedures 
should make provision for facilitating the 
comment of public and private organiza-
tions and individuals by announcing the 
availability of draft environmental state-
ments and by making copies available to 
organizations and individuals that have 
requested an opportunity to comment. 
Agencies should devise methods for pub-
licizing the existence of draft statements, 
for example, by publication in local news-
papers or by maintaining a list of groups 
known to be interested in the agency’s 
activities and directly notifying such 
groups of the existence of a draft state-
ment, or sending them a copy, as soon as 
it has been prepared.

(e) Responsibilities of commenting 
entities.—Agencies and members of the 
public submitting comments on proposed 
actions on the basis of draft environ-
mental impact statements should en-
deavor to make comments as specific, 
substantive, and factual as possible with-
out undue attention to matters of form in 
the impact statement. Emphasis should 
be placed primarily on the assessment 
of the environmental impacts of the pro-
posed action, and the acceptability of 
those impacts on the quality of the en-
vironment, particularly as contrasted 
with the impacts of reasonable alterna-
tives to the action. Commenting entities 
may recommend modifications to the 
proposed action and/or new alternatives 
that will avoid or minimize environ-
mental impacts.

(f) Agencies seeking comment may 
establish time limits of not less than 45 
days for reply, after which it may be pre-
sumed, unless the agency or party con-
sulted requests a specified extension of 
time, that the agency or party consulted 
has no comment to make. Agencies seek-
ing comment should endeavor to comply 
with requests for extensions of time of 
up to 15 days.

10. Preparation and circulation of final 
environmental impact statements.— (a) 
Agencies should make every effort to 
discover and discuss all major points of 
view on the environmental effects of 
the proposed action and its alternatives 
in the draft statement itself. However, 
where opposing professional views and 
responsible opinion have been over-
looked in the draft statement and are 
brought to the agency’s attention 
through the commenting process, the 
agency should review the environmental 
effects of the action in light of those 
views and should make a meaningful 
reference in the final statement to the 
existence of any responsible opposing 
view not adequately discussed in the 
draft statement, indicating the agency’s 
response to the issues raised. All sub-
stantive comments received on the draft 
(or summaries thereof where response 
has been exceptionally voluminous) 
should be attached to the final statement, 
whether or not each such comment is 
thought to merit individual discussion 
by the agency in the text of the state-
ment.

(b) Copies of final statements, with 
comments attached, shall be sent to all

Federal, State, and local agencies and 
private organizations that made sub-
stantive comments on the draft state-
ment and to individuals who requested 
a copy of the final statement. Where the 
number of comments on a draft state-
ment is such that distribution of the 
final statement to all commenting en-
tities appears impracticable, the agency 
shall consult with the Council concern-
ing alternative arrangements for dis-
tribution of the statement.

11. Distribution of statements to Coun-
cil on Environmental Quality; minimum 
priods for review and advance availabil-
ity; availability to public.— (a) As soon 
as they have been prepared, 10 copies of 
draft environmental statements, 5 copies 
of all comments made thereon (to be 
forwarded to the Council by the entity 
making comment at the time comment 
is forwarded to the responsible agency), 
and 10 copies of the final text of en-
vironmental statements (together with 
the substance of all comments received 
thereon by the responsible agency from 
Federal, State, and local agencies and 
from private private organizations and 
individuals) shall be supplied to the 
Council on Environmental Quality in the 
Executive Office of the President (this 
will serve bo meet the statutory require-
ment to make environmental statements 
available to the President). At the same 
time that copies are sent to the Council, 
copies of final statements should also 
be sent to relevant commenting entities 
as set forth in section 10(b) of these 
guidelines.

(b) To the maximum extent practi-
cable no administrative action subject 
to section 102(2) (C) is to be taken sooner 
than 90 days after a draft environmental 
statement has been circulated for com-
ment, furnished to the Council and, ex-
cept where advance public disclosure 
will result in significantly increased costs 
of procurement to the Government, made 
available to the public pursuant to these 
guidelines; neither should such adminis-
trative action be taken sooner than 30 
days after the final text of an environ-
mental statement (together with com-
ments) has been made available to the 
Council, commenting agencies, and the 
public. If the final text of an environ-
mental statement is filed within 90 days 
after a draft statement has been circu-
lated for comment, furnished to the 
Council and made public pursuant to this 
section of these guidelines, the 30-day 
period and 90-day period may run con-
currently to the extent that they overlap. 
An agency may supplement or amend a 
draft or final environmental statement, 
m such cases the agency should consult 
with the Council on Enviromental Qual-
ity with respect to the possible need for 
or desirability of recirculation of the 
statement for the appropriate period.

(c) The Council will publish weekly in 
the Fe d e r a l  R e g is t e r  lists Of environ-
mental statements received during the 
preceding week that are available for 
public comment. The date of receipt by 
the Council, as noted in the Fe d e r a l  Reg- 
i s t r  publication, shall be the date from
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which the minimum periods for review 
and advance availability of statements 
shall be calculated.
. (d) The Council’s publication of no-

tice of the availability of statements is 
in addition to the agency’s responsibility, 
as described in section 9(d) of these 
guidelines, to insure the fullest practica-
ble provision of timely public informa-
tion concerning the existence and avail-
ability of environmental statements. The 
agency responsible for the environmental 
statement is also responsible for making 
the statement, the comments received, 
and any underlying documents available 
to the public pursuant to the provisions 
of the Freedom of Information Act (5 
U.S.C., sec. 552), without regard to the 
exclusion of intragency or interagency 
memoranda when such memoranda 
transmit comments of Federal agencies 
on the environmental impact of the pro-
posed action pursuant to section 9 of 
these guidelines. Agency procedures pre-
pared pursuant to section 3(a) of these 
guidelines shall implement these public 
information requirements and shall In-
clude arrangements for availability of 
environmental statements and comments 
at the head and appropriate regional 
offices of tiie responsible agency and at 
appropriate State, regional, and metro-
politan clearinghouses unless the Gov-
ernor of the State involved designates 
some other point for receipt of this in-
formation. Notice of such designation of 
an alternate point for receipt of this in-
formation shall be included in the Office 
of Management and Budget listing of 
clearinghouses referred to in section 
9(c).

(e) Where emergency circumstances 
make it necessary to take an action with 
significant environmental impact with-
out observing the provisions of these 
guidelines concerning minimum periods 
for agency review and advance availabil-
ity of environmental statements, the 
Federal agency proposing to take the ac-
tion should consult with the Council on 
Environmental Quality about alternative 
arrangements. Similarly where there are 
overriding considerations of expense to 
the government or impaired program ef-
fectiveness, the responsible agency 
should consult with the Council concern-
ing appropriate modifications of the 
minimum periods.

(f) In order to assist the Council on 
Environmental Quality in fulfilling its 
responsibilities under the Act and under 
Executive Order 11514, all agencies shall 
(as required by Section 102(2) (H) of the 
Act and section 3(i) of Executive Order 
11514) be responsive to requests by tire 
Council for reports and other informa-
tion dealing with issues arising in con-
nection with the implementation of the 
Act. hi particular, agencies shall be re-
sponsive to requests by the Council for 
either the preparation and circulation of 
environmental statements or, in the al-
ternative, if the responsible agency deter-
mines that an environmental statement 
is not required, for an environmental 
assessment and a publicly available rec-
ord briefly setting forth the reasons for

that determination. In no case, how-
ever, shall the Council’s silence or failure 
to request action with respect to an 
environmental statement be construed as 
bearing in any way on the question of 
the legal requirement for or the adequacy 
of such statements under the Act.

12. Legislative actions.— (a) The
Council on Environmental Quality and 
the Office of Management and Budget 
will cooperate in giving guidance as 
needed to assist agencies in identifying 
legislative items believed to have en-
vironmental significance. Efforts shall be 
made to identify types of repetitive legis-
lation requiring environmental impact 
statements (such as certain types of bills 
affecting transportation policy or annual 
construction authorizations) to assure 
preparation of impact statements prior 
to submission of such legislative pro-
posals to the Office of Management and 
Budget.

(b) With respect to recommendations 
or reports on proposals for legislation to 
which section 102(2) (C) applies, the 
final text of the environmental state-
ment and comments thereon should be 
available to the Congress and to the pub-
lic for consideration in connection with 
the proposed legislation or report. In 
cases where the scheduling of congres-
sional hearings on recommendations or 
reports on proposals for legislation which 
the Federal agency has forwarded to the 
Congress does not allow adequate time 
for the completion of a final text of an 
environmental statement (together with 
comments), a draft environmental state-
ment may be furnished to the Congress 
and made available to the public pend-
ing transmittal of the comments as re-
ceived and the final text.

13. Application of section 102(2) (C) 
procedure to existing projects and pro-
grams.—The section 102(2) (C) proce-
dure shall be applied to further major 
Federal actions having a significant 
effect on the environment even though 
they arise from projects or programs 
initiated prior to enactment of the Act 
on January 1, 1970. While the status of 
the work and degree of completion may 
be considered in determining whether to 
proceed with the project, it is essential 
that the environmental impacts of pro-
ceeding are reassessed pursuant to the 
Act’s policies and procedures and, if the 
project or program is continued, that 
further incremental major actions be 
shaped so as to minimize adverse en-
vironmental consequences. It is also im-
portant in further action that account 
be taken of environmental consequences 
not fully evaluated at the outset of the 
project or program.

14. Supplem entary guidelines, evalua-
tions o f procedures.— (a) The Council 
on Environmental Quality after exam-
ining environmental statements and 
agency procedures with respect to such 
statements will issue such supplements 
to these guidelines as are necessary.

Ob) Agencies will continue to assess 
their experience in the implementation 
of the section 102(2) (C) provisions of 
the Act and in conforming with these

guidelines and report thereon to the 
Council on Environmental Quality by 
December 1, 1973. Such reports should 
include an identification of the problem 
areas and suggestions for revision or 
clarification of these guidelines to 
achieve effective coordination of views 
on environmental aspects (and alterna-
tives, where appropriate) of proposed 
actions without imposing unproductive 
administrative procedures. Such reports 
shall also indicate what progress the 
agency has made in developing substan-
tive criteria and guidance for making en-
vironmental assessments as required by 
section 6(c) of this directive and by sec-
tion 102(2) (B) of the Act.

15. Effective date.—The revisions of 
these guidelines shall apply to all draft 
and final impact statements filed with 
the Council more than 90 days after the 
publication of this directive in final form 
in the Fe d e r a l  R e g is t e r .

R u s s e l l  E. T r a in , 
Chairman.

Ap p e n d i x  I

(Check one). ( ) Draft. ( ) Final
Environmental Statement.

Name o f Responsible Federal Agency (with 
name of operating division where appropri-
ate).

1. Name of Action. (Check one) ( )
Administrative Action. ( ) Legislative
Action.

2. Brief description of action indicating 
what States (and counties) particularly 
affected.

3. Summary of environmental Impact and 
adverse environmental effects.

4. List alternatives considered.
5. a. (For draft statements) List all Fed-

eral, State, and local agencies from which 
comments have been requested.

b. (For final statements) List all Federal, 
State, and local agencies and other sources 
from which written comments have been 
received.

6. Dates draft statement and final state-
ment made available to Council on Environ-
mental Quality and public.
Ap p e n d i x  II— Fe d e r a l  Ag e n c ie s  a n d  Fe d e r a l  

St a t e  Ag e n c ie s  1 Wi t h  Ju r i s d i c t i o n  b y  
La w  o r  Sp e c ia l  Ex p e r t i s e  t o  Co m m e n t  o n  
Va r io u s  T t p e s  o p  En v i r o n m e n t a l  I m p a c t s

a i r

Air Quality and Air Pollution Control
Department of Agriculture—

Forest Service (effects on vegetation). 
Atomic Energy Commission (radioactive 

substances).
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (Health aspects).
Environmental Protection Agency—

Air Pollution Control Office.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Mines (fossil and gaseous fuel 
combustion).

Bureau of S port Fisheries and Wildlife 
(wildlife).

National Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion (remote sensing, aircraft emissions).

1 River Basin Commissions (Delaware, 
Great Lakes, Missouri, New England, Ohio, 
Pacific Northwest, Souris-Red-Rainy, Sus-
quehanna, Upper Mississippi) and similar 
Federal-State agencies should be consulted 
on actions affecting the environment of their 
specific geographic jurisdictions.
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Department oi Transportation—
Assistant Secretary for Systems Develop-

ment and Technology (auto emissions). 
Coast Guard (vessel emissions).
Federal Aviation Administration (aircraft 

emissions).
Weather Modification

Department of Commerce—
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Ad-

ministration.
Department of Defense—

Department of the Air Force.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Reclamation.
Water Resources Council.

ENERGY

Energy Conservation
Department of the Interior—

Office of Energy Conservation.
Department of Commerce—

National Bureau of Standards (energy ef-
ficiency) .

Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment—

Federal Housing Administration (energy 
conservation in housing standards). 

General Services Administration (energy 
conservation in design and operation of 
buildings).

Environmental Aspects o f Electric Energy 
Generation and Transmission

Atomic Energy Commission (nuclear power). 
Environmental Protection Agencÿ—

Water Quality Office.
Air Pollution Control Office.

Department of Agriculture—
Rural Electrification Administration (rural 

areas).
Department of Defense—

Army Corps of Engineers (hydro-facilities). 
Federal Power Commission (hydro-facilities 

and transmission lines).
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment (urban areas).
Department of the Interior— (facilities on 

Government lands).
National Aeronautics and Space Administra-

tion (solar).
Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
Natural Gas Energy Development, 

Transmission and Generation
Federal Power Commission (natural gas pro-

duction, transmission and supply). 
Department of the Interior—

Geological Survey.
Bureau of Mines.

HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES

Toxic Materials
Atomic Energy Commission (radioactive sub-

stances) .
Department of Commerce—

National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-
istration.

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare (Health aspects).

Environmental Protection Agency. 
Department of Agriculture—

Agricultural Research Service.
Consumer and Marketing Service. 

Department of Defense.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife.

Pesticides
Department of Agriculture—

Agricultural Research Service (biological 
controls, food and fiber production). 

Consumer and Marketing Service.
Forest Service.

Department of Commerce—
National Marine Fisheries Service. 
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration.
Environmental Protection Agency—

Office of Pesticides.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife 
(effects on fish and wildlife).

Bureau of Land Management.
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (Health aspects).

Herbicides
Department of Agriculture—

Agricultural Research Service.
Forest Service.

Environmental Protection Agency—
Office oî Pesticides.

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare (Health aspects).

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Bureau of Land Management.
Bureau of Reclamation.

Transportation and Handling o f Hazardous 
Materials

Department of Commerce—
Maritime Administration.
National Marine Fisheries Service. 
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration (impact on marine life ). 
Department of D efen se -

Armed Services Explosive Safety Board. 
Army Corps of Engineers (navigable water-

ways) .
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare—
Office of the Surgeon General (Health as-

pects) .
Department of Transportation—

Federal Highway Administration, Bureau 
of Motor Carrier Safety.

Coast Guard.
Federal Railroad Administration.
Federal Aviation Administration.
Assistant Secretary for Systems Develop-

ment and Technology.
Office of Hazardous Materials.
Office of Pipeline Safety.

Environmental Protection Agency (hazardous 
substances).

Atomic Energy Commission (radioactive 
substances).

LAND USE AND M ANAG EM ENT 

Esthetics 2
Coastal Areas: Wetlands, Estuaries, Water- 

fowl Refuges, and Beaches
Department of Agriculture*—

Forest Service.
Department of Commerce—

National Marine Fisheries Service (impact 
on marine life).

National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-
istration (impact on marine life). 

Department of Transportation—
Coast Guard (bridges, navigation). 

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers (beaches, dredge 

and fill permits, Refuse Act permits). 
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
National Park Service.
U.S. Geological Survey (coastal geology). 
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation (beaches). 

Department of Agriculture—
Soil Conservation Service (soil stability, 

hydrology).

2 Numerous agencies have developed spe-
cific methods of assessing esthetics in rela-
tion to their area of responsibility.

Environmental Protection Agency—
Water Quality Office.

National Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion (remote sensing).

Water Resources Council.
River Basin Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
Historic and Archeological Sites

Department of the Interion—
National Park Service.

Advisory Council on Historic Preservation. 
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment (urban areas).
Flood Plains and Watersheds

Department of Agriculture—
Agricultural Stabilization and Research 

Service.
Soil Conservation Service.
Forest Service.

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Bureau of Reclamation.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Bureau of Land Measurement.
U.S. Geological Survey.

Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment (urban areas).

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers.

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
Mineral Land Reclamation

Appalachian Regional Commission. 
Department of Agriculture—

Forest Service.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Mines.
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Bureau of Land Management.
U.S. Geological Survey.

Tennessee Valley Authority.
Parks, Forests, and Outdoor Recreation

Department of Agriculture—
Forest Service.
Soil Conservation Service.

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Land Management.
National Park Service.
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers.

Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment (urban areas).

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
Soil and Plant Life, Sedimentation, Erosion 

and Hydrologic Conditions
Department of Agriculture—

Soil Conservation Service.
Agricultural Research Service.
Forest Service.

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers (dredging, 

aquatic plants).
Department of Commerce—

National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-
istration.

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Land Management.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Geological Survey.
Bureau of Reclamation.

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
NOISE

Noise Control and Abatement
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (Health aspects).
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Department of Commerce—
National Bureau of Standards.

Departm ent of Transportation—
Assistant Secretary for Systems Develop-

ment and Technology.
Federal Aviation Administration (Office of 

Noise Abatement).
Environmental Protection Agency (Office of 

Noise).
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment (urban land use aspects, building 
materials standards).

National Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion (aircraft noise abatement and con-
trol).
PHYSIOLOGICAL H E ALTH  AND H U M A N  W ELL 

BEING

Chemical Contamination o f  Food Products
Department of Agriculture—

Consumer and Marketing Service. 
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (health aspects).
Environmental Protection Agency—

Office of Pesticides (economic poisons).
Food Additives and Food Sanitation

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare (Health aspects).

Environmental Protection Agency—
Office of Pesticides (economic poisons, e.g., 

pesticide residues).
Department of Agriculture—

Consumer and Marketing Service (meat 
and poultry products).

Microbiological Contamination
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (Health aspects).
Radiation and Radiological Health

Department of Commerce—
National Bureau of Standards.

Atomic Energy Commission.
Environmental Protection Agency—

Office of Radiation.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Mines (uranium mines).
Sanitation and Waste Systems

Atomic Energy Commission 
(radioactive waste).

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare— (Health aspects).

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers.

Environmental Protection Agency—
Solid Waste Officie.
Water Quality Office.

Department of Transportation—
U.S. Coast Quard (ship sanitation). 

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Mines (mineral waste and re-

cycling, mine acid wastes, urban solid 
wastes).

Bureau of Land Management (solid wastes 
on public lands).

Office of Saline Water (demineralization 
of liquid wastes) •

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geograph-

ically appropriate).
Shellfish Sanitation

Department o f  Com m erce—
National Marine Fisheries Service.
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration.
Department of Health, Education, and Wel-

fare (Health aspects).
Environmental Protection Agency—

Office of Water Quality.
TRANSPORTATION

Air Quality
Environm ental Protection Agency—

Air Pollution Control Office.

Department of Transportation—
Federal Aviation Administration. 

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 

Department of Commerce—
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration (meteorological conditions). 
National Aeronautics and Space Administra-

tion (aviation).
Water Quality

Environmental Protection Agency—
Office of Water Quality.

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 

Department of Commerce—
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration (impact on marine life and 
ocean monitoring).

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers.

Department of Transportation—
Coast Guard.

Water Resources Council.
URBAN

Congestion in Urban Areas, Housing and 
Building Displacement

Department of Transportation—
Federal Highway Administration.

Office of Economic Opportunity.
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Environmental Effects With Special Impact 

in Low-Income Neighborhoods
Department of the Interior—

National Park Service.
Office of Economic Opportunity.
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment (urban areas).
Department of Commerce (economic develop-

ment areas).
Economic Development Administration. 

Department of Transportation—
Urban Mass Transportation Administration. 

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
Rodent Control

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare (health aspects).

Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment (urban areas).

Urban Planning
Department of Transportation—

Federal Highway Administration. 
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-

ment.
Environmental Protection Agency. 
Department of the Interior—

Geological Survey.
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.

Department of Commerce—
Economic Development Administration. 

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
WATER

Water Quality and Water Pollution Control
Department of Agriculture—

Soil Conservation Service.
Forest Service.

Atomic Energy Commission (Radioactive 
substances).

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Reclamation.
Bureau of Land Management.
Bureau of Sports Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.
Geological Survey.
Office of Saline Water.

Environmental Protection Agency—
Water Quality Office.

Department of Health, Education, and Wel-
fare (Health aspects).

Department of Defense—
Army Corps of Engineers.
Department of the Navy (ship pollution 

control).
National Aeronautics and Space Administra-

tion (remote sensing).
Department of Transportation—

Coast Guard (oil spills, ship sanitation). 
Department of Commerce—

National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-
istration

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geograph-

ically appropriate).
Marine Pollution

Department of Commerce—
National Oceanic and Atmospheric Admin-

istration.
Department of Transportation—

Coast Guard.
Department of Defense—

Army Corps of Engineers.
Office of Oceanographer of the Navy. 

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
River and Canal Regulation and Stream 

Channelisation
Department of Agriculture—

Soil Conservation Service.
Department of Defense—

Army Corps of Engineers.
Department of the Interior—

Bureau of Reclamation.
Geological Survey.
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 

Department of Transportation—
Coast Guard.

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
W ILDLIFE

Environmental Protection Agency. 
Department of Agriculture—

Forest Service.
Soil Conservation Service.

Department of the Interior—
Bureau of Sport Fisheries and Wildlife. 
Bureau of Land Management.
Bureau of Outdoor Recreation.

Water Resources Council.
River Basins Commissions (as geographically 

appropriate).
F e d e r a l  A g e n c y  a n d  F e d e r a l - S t a t e  A g e n c y  

O f f i c e s  f o r  R e c e i v i n g  a n d  C o o r d i n a t i n g  
C o m m e n t s  U p o n  E n v i r o n m e n t a l  I m p a c t  
S t a t e m e n t s

ADVISORY CO U N CIL O N  H ISTOR IC PRESERVATION

Office of the Executive Director, suite 618, 
801 19th Street NW., Washington, D.C. 
20006,343—8607.

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

Office of the Secretary, Washington, D.C. 
20260, 447-7803.

APPALACHIAN REGIONAL C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Alternate Federal Co-Chairman, 
1666 Connecticut Avenue NW., Washington, 
D.C. 20235,067-4103.

DEPARTMENT OF T H E  A R M Y  (CORPS OF 
ENGINEERS)

Executive Director of Civil Works, Office of 
the Chief of Engineers, Washington, D.C. 
20314, 693-7168.

ATO M IC ENERGY C O M M IS S IO N

For nonregulatory matters : Director, Office of 
Environmental Affairs, Washington, D.C. 
20545, 973-5391. .
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For regulatory matters: Office of the Assist-
ant Director for Regulation, Washington, 
D.C. 20545, 973-7531.

DEPARTMENT OF COMM ERCE

Office of the Deputy Assistant Secretary for 
Environmental Affairs, Washington, D.C. 
20230, 967-4335.

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE

Office of the Assistant Secretary for Defense 
(Health and Environment), Room 3E172, 
the Pentagon, Washington, D.C. 20301, 
697-2111.

DELAWARE RIVER BASIN C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Secretary, P.O. Box 360, Trenton, 
N.J. 08603, 609-883-9500.

EN VIRO N M EN TAL PROTECTION AGENCY 3

Director, Office of Federal Activities, Environ-
mental Protection Agency, 401 M Street 
NW., Washington, D.C. 20460, 755-0777.

FEDERAL POW ER C O M M IS S IO N

Commission’s Advisor on Environmental 
Quality, 441 Q Street NW., Washington, 
D.C. 20426, 386-6084.

3 Contact the Office of Federal Activities for 
environmental statements concerning legisla-
tion,, regulations, national program proposals 
or other major policy issues.

For all other EPA consultation, contact the 
Regional Administrator in whose area the 
proposed action (e.g., highway or water re-
source construction projects) will take place. 
The Regional Administrators will coordinate 
the EPA review. Addresses of the Regional 
Administrators, and the areas covered by 
their regions are as follows:
Regional Administrator I, Room 2303, John 

F. Kennedy Federal Building, Boston, Mass. 
02203, 617-223-7210; Connecticut, Maine, 
Massachusetts, New Hampshire, Rhode Is-
land, Vermont.

Regional Administrator II, Room 908, 26 Fed-
eral Plaza, New York, N.Y. 10007, 212-264- 
2525; New Jersey, New York, Puerto Rico, 
Virgin Islands.

Regional Administrator III, Curtis Building, 
Sixth Floor, Sixth and Walnut Streets, 
Philadelphia, Pa. 19106, 215-597-9801;
Delaware, Maryland, Pennsylvania, Vir-
ginia, West Virginia, District of Columbia. 

Regional Administrator IV, Suite 300, 1421 
Peachtree Street NE., Atlanta, Ga. 30309, 
404-526-5727; Alabama, Florida, Georgia, 
Kentucky, Mississippi, North Carolina, 
South Carolina, Tennessee.

Regional Administrator V, 1 North Wacker 
Drive, Chicago, 111. 60606, 312-353-5250; 
Illinois, Indiana, Michigan, Minnesota, 
Ohio, Wisconsin.

Regional Administrator VI, 1600 Patterson 
Street, Suite 1100, Dallas, Tex. 75201, 214- 
749-1962; Arkansas, Louisiana, New Mex-
ico, Texas, Oklahoma.

Regional Administrator VII, 1735 Baltimore 
Avenue, Kansas City, Mo. 64108, 816-374- 
5493; Iowa, Kansas, Missouri, Nebraska. 

Regional Administrator VIII, Suite 900, Lin-
coln Tower, 1860 Lincoln Street, Denver, 
Colo. 80203, 303-837-3895; Colorado, Mon-
tana, North Dakota, South Dakota, Utah, 
Wyoming.

Regional Administrator IX , 100 California 
Street, Ban Francisco, Calif. 94111, 415- 
556-2320; Arizona, California, Hawaii, Ne-
vada, American Samoa, Guam, Trust Ter-
ritories of Pacific Islands, Wake Island. 

Regional Administrator X , 1200 Sixth Ave-
nue, Seattle, Wash. 98101, 206-442-1220; 
Alaska, Idaho, Oregon, Washington.

GENERAL SERVICES ADM IN ISTRATIO N

Office of Environmental Affairs, Office of the 
Commissioner, Public Buildings Service, 
Washington, D.C. 20405, 343-4193.

GREAT LAK ES BASIN C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Chairman, 3475 Summit Road, 
Ann Arbor, Mich. 48106, 313-769-7431.
DEPARTMENT OF H E ALTH , EDUCATION, AND 

WELFARE

Office of Environmental Affairs, Office of the 
Assistant Secretary for Community and 
Field Services, Washingtoh, D.C. 20202, 
962-5895.

DEPARTMENT OF H O U SIN G  AND URBAN 
BEVELOPMENT 4

Director, Office of Community and Environ-
mental Standards, room 7206, Washington, 
D.C. 20410, 755-5977.

DEPARTM ENT OF T H E  INTERIOR

Office of the Deputy Assistant Secretary for 
Programs, Washington, D.C. 20240, 343- 
6181.

M ISSO U R I RIVER BASIN S C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Chairman, 10050 Regency Cir-
cle, Omaha, Nebr. 68114, 402-397-5714.

N ATIO N AL CAPITAL P LA N N IN G  C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Executive Director, Washington, 
D.C. 20576, 382-1163.
N E W  ENGLAND RIVER BASIN S C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Chairman, 55 Court Street, Bos-
ton, Mass. 02108, 617-223-6244.

4 Contact the Director with regard to en-
vironmental impacts of legislation, policy 
statements, program regulations and proce-
dures, and precedent-making project deci-
sions. For all other HUD consultation, con-
tact the HUD Regional Administrator in 
whose Jurisdiction the project lies, as fol-
lows:
Regional Administrator I, Environmental 

Clearance Officer, room 405, John F. Ken-
nedy Federal Building, Boston, Mass. 
02203, 617-223-4066.

Regional Administrator n , Environmental 
Clearance Officer, 26 Federal Plaza, New 
York, N.Y. 10007, 212-264-8068.

Regional Administrator III, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, Curtis Building, Sixth 
and Walnut Streets, Philadelphia, Pa. 
19106, 215-597-2560.

Regional Administrator IV, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, Peachtree-Seventh Build-
ing, Atlanta, Ga. 30323, 404-526-5585. 

Regional Administrator V, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, 360 North Michigan Ave-
nue, Chicago, 111. 60601, 312-353-5680. 

Regional Administrator VI, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, Federal Office Building, 
819 Taylor Street, Fort Worth, Tex. 76102, 
817-334-2867.

Regional Administrator VII, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, 911 Walnut Street, Kan-
sas City, Mo. 64106, 816-374^-2661. 

Regional Administrator VIII, Environmental 
Clearance Officer, Samsonite Building, 1051 
South Broadway, Denver, Colo. 80209, 303- 
837-4061.

Regional Administrator IX , Environmental 
Clearance Officer, 450 Golden Gate Avenue, 
P.O. Box 36003, San Francisco, Calif., 94102, 
415-556-4752.

Regional Administrator X , Environmental 
Clearance Officer, room 226, Arcade Plaza 
Building, Seattle, Wash. 98101, 206-583- 
5415.

OFFICE OF ECO N OM IC O PPO RTU N ITY

Office of the Director, 1200 19th Street NW., 
Washington, D.C. 20506', 254-6000.

O H IO  RIVER BASIN  C O M M ISSIO N

Office of the Chairman, 36 East 4th Street, 
suite 208-20, Cincinnati, Ohio 45202, 513- 
684-3831.

PACIFIC N O RTH W EST RIVER BASIN S 
C O M M IS S IO N

Office of the Chairman, 1 Columbia River, 
Vancouver, Wash. 98660, 206—695—3606.

SO U R IS-R E D -R A IN Y  RIVER BASIN S COMMISSION

Office of the Chairman, suite 6, Professional 
Building, Holiday Mall, Moorhead, Minn. 
56560, 701-237-5227.

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Office of the Special Assistant to the Sec-
retary for Environmental Affairs, Washing-
ton, D.C. 20520, 632-7964.

SUSQ U EHAN A RIVER BASIN CO M M ISSIO N

Office of the Water Resources Coordinator, 
Department of Environmental Resources, 
105 South Office Building, Harrisburg, Pa. 
17120, 717-787-2315.

TENNESSEE VALLEY AU TH O R ITY

Office of the Director of Environmental Re-
search and Development, 720 Edney Build-
ing, Chattanooga, Tenn. 37401, 615-755- 
2002.

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Office of the Assistant Secretary for Environ-
ment, Safety, and Consumer Affairs, Wash-
ington, D.C. 20590, 426-4474.

DEPARTMENT OF TREASURY

Office of Assistant Secretary for Administra-
tion, Washington, D.C. 20220, 964-5391.
UPPER M IS S IS S IPP I RIVER BASIN COMM ISSION

Office of the Chairman, Federal Office Build-
ing, Fort Snelling, Twin Cities, Minn. 55111, 
612-725-4690.

WATER RESOURCES COUN CIL

Office of the Associate Director, 2120 L Street 
NW., suite 800, Washington, D.C. 20037, 
254-6442.

A p p e n d i x  III— S t a t e  a n d  L o c a l  A g e n c y  
R e v i e w  o f  I m p a c t  S t a t e m e n t s

1. OBM Circular No. A-95 through its sys-
tem of clearinghouses provides a means for 
securing the views of State and local en-
vironmental agencies, which can assist in the 
preparation of impact statements. Under 
A-95, review of the proposed project in the 
case of federally assisted projects (part I of 
A-95) generally takes place prior to the prep-
aration of the impact statement. Therefore, 
comments on the environmental effects of 
the proposed project that are secured during 
this stage of the A-95 process represent In-
puts to the environmental impact statement.

2. In the case of direct Federal develop-
ment (part II of A -9 5 ), Federal agencies are 
required to consult with clearinghouses at 
the earliest practicable time in the planning 
of the project or activity. Where such con-
sultation occurs prior to completion of the 
draft impact statement, comments relating 
to the environmental effects of the proposed 
action would also represent inputs to the en-
vironmental impact statement.

3. In either case, whatever com m ents are 
made on environmental effects of proposed 
Federal or federally assisted projects by clear-
inghouses, or by State and local environ-
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mental agencies through clearinghouses, in 
the course of the A-95 review should be at-
tached to the draft impact statement when it 
is circulated for review. Copies of the state-
ment should be sent to the agencies making 
such comments. Whether those agencies then 
elect to comment again on the basis of the 
draft impact statement is a matter to be left 
to the discretion of the commenting agency 
depending on its resources, the significance 
of the project, and the extent to which its 
earlier comments were considered in pre-
paring the draft statement.

4. The clearinghouses may also be used, by 
mutual agreement, for securing reviews of 
the draft environmental impact statement. 
However, the Federal agency may wish to deal 
directly with appropriate State or local agen-
cies in the review of impact statements be-
cause the clearinghouses may be unwilling or 
unable to handle this phase of the process. 
In some cases, the Governor may have des-
ignated a specific agency, other than the 
clearinghouse, for securing reviews of im-
pact statements. In any case, the clearing-
houses should be sent copies of the impact 
statement.

5. To aid clearinghouses in coordinating 
State and local comments, draft statements 
should include copies of State and local 
agency comments made earlier under the A -  
95 process and should indicate on the sum-
mary sheet those other agencies from which 
comments have been requested, as specified 
in appendix I of the CEQ guidelines.
S e c t i o n - b y - S e c t i o n  C o m m e n t  a n d  E x p l a n a -

t i o n  o p  M a j o r  P r o p o s e d  R e v i s i o n s

1. Purpose and authority .— This section 
remains basically unchanged, except for 
minor stylistic revisions and expanded refer-
ence in subsection (a) (purpose) to national 
goals described in section 2 of NEPA. In addi-

tion a new subsection (b) has been added 
making explicit the basis of the Council’s 
role in the NEPA process.

The former reference to EPA’s implementa-
tion of section 309 of the Clean Air Act is 
replaced with a more general reference to all 
commenting entities in order to reflect more 
accurately the matters covered by the new 
directive.

2. Policy.— This section reenforces the 
former emphasis on early consideration of 
environmental issues in agency planning, and 
explains in general terms the function of 
the environmental impact statement process 
in meeting this objective. The emphasis on 
early preparation of statements accords with 
the directive in section 102(2) (C) of the Act 
that such statements “accompany the pro-
posal through the existing agency review 
process.” It also accords with results of re-
view sessions held last July by the Council 
with major Federal agencies following issu-
ance of the GAO Report on Improvements 
Needed in Federal Efforts to Implement 
NEPA.

3. Agency and OMB Procedures.— (c) [Re-
quirement for Agency Procedures],— This 
subsection reaffirms the previous direction 
to agencies to develop their own NEPA proce-
dures and requires further revision as neces-
sary to reflect new changes in the CEQ guide-
lines. New provisions also require agencies to 
consult with CEQ in developing or revising 
procedures and to notice significant proposed 
revisions for public comment.

(b ) [Consultation with other agencies] ,—  
This subsection retains the previous recom-
mendation for consultation with other agen-
cies in developing or revising NEPA pro-
cedures and incorporates and clarifies the 
P ilo u s  reference (former sec. 3 (c )) to 
OMB Circular A-85 as the means for ob- 
ainlng state and local review of such pro-

cedures.

(c) [Use of existing mechanisms],— This 
is former section 3 (d ) , essentially unchanged.

4. Federal agencies included; effect of Act 
on existing agency mandates.— This section 
adds additional language to former section 
4 to emphasize that NEPA expands the tra-
ditional mandates of agencies covered by 
the Act— a view that is fully supported both 
by the legislative history of the Act, see, e.g., 
Hearings on S. 1075, S. 237, and S. 1752 Before 
Senate Committee on Interior and Insular 
Affairs, 91st Cong., 1st Sess. 206 (1969); 115 
Cong. Rec. (part 30) 40416 (1969) (remarks 
of Senator Jackson), and by early and con-
sistent judicial opinion. See, e.g., Calvert 
Cliffs v. AEC, 2 ERC 1779, 1780-81 (D.C. Cir. 
1971); Zabel v. Tabb, 1 ERC 1449, 1457-59 
(5th Cir. 1970).

5. Actions included .— The nonapplicability 
of the impact statement process to general 
revenue sharing is confirmed.

The former section 5(d) of the CEQ guide-
lines, exempting all of EPA’s environmental 
protective regulatory activities from the re-
quirements of section 102(2) (C ), has been 
deleted in recognition of the fact that new 
section 511(c) of the Federal Water Pollu-
tion Control Act Amendments of 1972 now 
specifically addresses this issue, requiring 
EPA to prepare impact statements in some 
cases, and exempting EPA from the require-
ment in other cases. This general matter will 
be addressed in EPA’s NEPA procedures is-
sued pursuant to section 3(a) of these guide-
lines.

6. Identifying "major,”  environmentally 
" significant”  actions.— This new section com-
bines parts of the existing guidelines with 
new directives for interpreting and applying 
these key words of the. Act.

(a) General guidance from previous sec-
tion 5(b) is included here about the statu-
tory criteria for determining when an EIS 
is required. (The discussion of the "lead 
agency” concept has been moved to the fol-
lowing section (sec. 7 (c ) ).)

(b) More specific guidance is included here 
concerning factors to consider in assessing 
“significance.” Specific cross-reference is 
made to appendix II which contains a list 
of typical kinds of environmental impact 
to consider in making this assessment in-
cluding a new reference to “energy conser-
vation.”

(c) This subsection indicates that each 
agency should supplement the general CEQ 
criteria with specific criteria, and review its 
typical actions to determine those that will 
require statements and those that will not. 
With respect to remaining actions and ac-
tions likely to require statements, agencies 
are to develop guidance, indicating for par-
ticular kinds of projects how environmental 
impact is to be determined. The emphasis 
on agency responsibility to develop, such cri-
teria for making environmental assessments 
accords with longstanding CEQ policy and 
with provisions contained in recommenda-
tion No. 1 of the CEQ’s memorandum of 
May 16, 1972. See 3 Environmental Reporter 
83 (“Current Developments,” May 19, 1972).

(d) This subsection emphasizes the use-
fulness and desirability of program or over-
view statements, in accord with recommenda-
tion No. 9 of the CEQ May 16 memo, 3 ER 
87.

7. Procedures for preparing draft EIS’s .—  
This is a new section, discussing procedural 
aspects of preparing draft statements.

(a) Because the decision whether or not 
to prepare an impact statement is a crucial 
point in the 102 process, this subsection adds 
new provisions for making public the decision 
when it is made. The “notice of intent” de-
vice was previously recommended in the 
May 16 memo (see Rec. No. 5, 3 ER 85-86).

(b ) This subsection provides a general 
overview  o f  the 102 process from draft 
through final, em phasizing again the impor-
tance o f early preparation pursuant to the 
policy o f section  2.

(c )  The "lead agency” concept is clarified 
here, and the desirability of joint statements 
is em phasized in  accordance with Re com-» 
m endation  No. 8 of the May 16 memo, 3 ER 
86-87 (attached, app. A ), and with similar 
recom m endations made both by agencies and 
environm ental organizations. The section 
also m akes clear that where a “lead agency” 
prepares the statement, input from other 
participating agencies should still be secured. 
Finally, additional factors relevant to selec-
tion of a lead agency are specified.

(d) This subsection responds to the deci-
sion in Greene County Planning Board v. 
FPC, 3 ERC 1595 (2d Cir., 1972), prohibiting 
the use of applicant EIS’s. Some flexibility is 
preserved, however, to permit the use (after 
review) of initial information furnished by 
an applicant in the form of an EIS.

(e) This is a revision and codification of 
what appears in sections 6(d) and 10(e) of 
the existing guidelines, with some additional 
general guidance about when to hold hear-
ings. Agencies are also asked to identify in 
their procedures contexts in which hearings 
are normally held as part of the review proc-
ess. The final clause of the former section 
10(e) has been deleted in response to the 
decision in Greene County, supra.

8. Content o f EIS’s. (a) The points to be 
covered have been reorganized and new lan-
guage has been added: (1) Emphasizing the 
need for a comprehensive but comprehensible 
description of the proposed action and the 
existing environment and for accurate pop-
ulation data, identified by source, in making 
assessments of population Impact; (2) illus-
trating the range of environmental values 
which agencies should keep in mind in eval-
uating proposals, and indicating that the ef-
fect on the international environment is 
also to be assessed where relevant; and (3) 
discussing the kind^ of secondary effects to 
which agencies should be alert in making 
environmental assessments.

Additional language in the discussion of 
alternatives (sec. 8(a) (ill),) reflects the de-
cision in NRDC v. Morton, 3 ERC 1558 (D.C. 
Cir. 1972) and Recommendation No. 4 in the 
CEQ May 16 memo, 3 ER 83-84.

(b) This subsection emphasizes the im-
portance of substance over form in the con-
tent of EIS’s, and stresses the primary EIS 
function of serving as a full disclosure docu-
ment. The reference to incorporation of un-
derlying documents is from Recommendation 
No. 6 of the May 16 memo, 3 ER 86.

(c) This is former section 6 (c ), with ad-
ditional language clarifying the act’s refer-
ence to use of an “interdisciplinary” 
approach.

9. Review o f draft EIS’s.— (a) Review by 
Federal agencies is discussed here, incorpo-
rating parts of former section 7 with minor 
revisions, and adding a discussion of the re-
lationship of section 102(2) (C) to other 
Federal statutes requiring consultation and 
coordination. The deletion of the clause in 
the first sentence of former section 7 is re-
sponsive to the decision in Greene County, 
supra. The list of relevant commenting agen-
cies has been moved to the appendix.

(b) This subsection relates EPA review of 
EIS’s under section 309 of the Clean Air 
Act to the EIS process generally and requires 
prompt notification of the Council where 
statements are rated inadequate or projects 
are determined to be environmentally 
unsatisfactory.

(c) Procedures for securing State and local 
review are referenced here to the recent joint 
CEQ—OMB memorandum. This joint memo-
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randum has been, attached to the guidelines 
as an appendix, thus allowing modification as 
necessary without necessitating full revision 
of the CEQ guidelines. This subsection re-
places former section 9 of the guidelines.

(d) A new subsection is added discussing 
arrangements for securing public review of 
statements. The discussion reflects Recom-
mendation No. 7 of the May 16 memo, 3 
ER 86.

(e) This subsection is new, providing gen-
eral guidance for commenting entities.

(f) The time limits for review have been 
expanded to 45 days for all commenting en-
tities. Under present guidelines, agencies 
must allow 45 days for comment by EPA in 
any event, so that there seems little reason 
not to make this commenting period 
uniform.

10. Preparation and circulation o f final 
statements.— (a), (b) These subsections in-
corporate Recommendation No. 3 of the 
May 16 memo, 3 ER 84-85.

11. Distribution of statem ents; minimum  
periods for review and advance availability.—  
(a ), (b) These subsections include relevant 
portions of former section 10(b), retaining

PROPOSED RULES

provisions concerning number of copies to 
file with CEQ and waiting periods prior to 
action. Additional language at the end of 
subsection (b) draws attention to the pos-
sibility of amending and recirculating state-
ments, as further discussed in the Council’s 
“Third Annual Report,” chapter 7, pages 
238-239.

(c) This subsection indicates how time pe-
riods are to be calculated. The periods for 
review and advance availability of statements 
run from the date of receipt of the EIS by 
CEQ, as per Recommendation No. 7 of the 
May 16 memo, 3 ER 86.

(d ) , (e) Substantially unchanged.
(f) This subsection describes in general 

terms the Council’s role in the EIS process, 
including the Council’s authority to require 
agencies to prepare either an EIS or, if the 
responsible agency has determined an EIS 
is not required, a publicly available record 
of the reasons for that determination.

12. Legislative actions.— (a) This general 
language concerning application of section 
102 in the legislative process corresponds to 
agreements reached between CEQ and OMB 
last fall after the July agency review sessions 
to followup the GAO report.

(b) Former section 10(c).
13. Application to existing projects and 

programs.— This section has been slightly 
revised to make clear that the act applies to 
major actions yet to be taken on environ-
mentally significant projects, even though 
such projects were begun prior to passage of 
the act. This view is now supported by over-
whelming judicial precedent, see, e.g., Jica~ 
rilla Apache Tribe v. Morton, 4  ERC 1933 (9th 
Cir., Jan. 2, 1973); EDF v. TV A, 4  ERC 1850 
(6th Cir., Dec. 13, 1972) (Tellico Dam case), 
and is consistent with the intent of the for-
mer section 11 of the CEQ guidelines.

14. Supplementary guidelines and evalua-
tions.— This section is former section 12, 
with a new sentence in subsection (b) re-
quiring agencies to report on their progress 
in developing substantive guidance for mak-
ing environmental assessments.

15. Effective date.— The amended guide-
lines will apply to all draft and final im-
pact statements filed with the Council more 
than 90 days after the publication of the 
revised guidelines in final form.

[FR Doc.73-8576 Filed 5 -l-7 3 ;8 :4 5  am]
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